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Ohio to Truncate Social Security Numbers 

 
 
Situation 
 
The Ohio Department of Job and Family Services (ODJFS) recently mailed letters notifying 
employers of impending changes in the way they will conduct business.  The changes, in 
turn, impact how the ODJFS Office of Unemployment Compensation (UC) will administer 
UC matters going forward.  
  
 
What is Changing and Why 
 
Beginning in December 2011, ODJFS will no longer display full Social Security numbers 
(SSN) on hard-copy correspondence; only the last four digits will be displayed.   The 
changes are prompted by the need to secure personal information and the desire to utilize 
technology. 
 
What this means is that various printed forms and notices issued by the ODJFS Office of 
UC will soon contain a truncated SSN only.  However, the agency continues to enhance 
UC Program administration through tools like the OJI System (Ohio Job Insurance) and 
SIDES (State Information Data Exchange System).  These systems provide access to full 
information, because they incorporate security measures like password-protection and 
encryption. 
 
 
What You Should Know 
 
TALX has experience dealing with truncated SSN’s and has built them into our processes, 
since the practice has become more common among state UC agencies.  You will see no 
effect in our service as a result of the truncation.  In fact, TALX already uses this security 
measure when corresponding with our clients about unemployment claim matters.  In 
addition, TALX is now using SIDES to exchange data with the ODJFS Office of UC, which 
is even more secure.  SIDES is a web-based system that allows transmission of 
information requests and replies back and forth between state UC agencies and Third 
Party Administrators. 
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What You Should Do 
 
In addition to the SSN truncation notification, the ODJFS letter contains information 
reminding employers about new hire reporting requirements, their wage and tax reporting 
obligations, options for reporting fraud, and information on the OJI benefits system.  A 
sample of the letter is provided below.   
 
We recommend you read the letter and keep the information on file; however, we caution 
TALX clients against logging into OJI and making any changes in how forms are currently 
handled, so as not to disrupt our current processes for UC matters. Since our processes 
now include the secure data file transmission via SIDES, be assured we will continue to 
effectively manage your claims.  
 
We will keep you informed, if there are any additional developments. 
 
If you have any questions, feel free to contact your TALX Client Relationship Manager. 
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